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RESOLUTION NO. ________________ 

RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE EXECUTION OF A NON-RESIDENTIAL SOLID 
WASTE COLLECTION AND DISPOSAL PERMIT AND AGREEMENT WITH  

SCARBROUGH ENTERPRISES, LLC 

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE CITY OF FORT 

SMITH, ARKANSAS, THAT:  

The Mayor, his signature attested by the City Clerk, is hereby authorized to 

execute the attached two (2) year Non-Residential Solid Waste Collection and Disposal 

Permit and Agreement with Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC for the period of July 1, 2023 

through June 30, 2025.  

This Resolution adopted this   day of July, 2023. 

APPROVED: 

_______ 
MAYOR 

ATTEST: 

_______ 
CITY CLERK 

Approved as to form: 

_____________________________NPR 
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NON-RESIDENTIAT SOTID WASTE COTTECTION AND DISPOSAT PERMIT AND AGREEMENT

IHIS AGREEMENT, made and entered on the date set forth below by and between the City of Fort
Smith, Arkansas (hereinafter referred to as the "City"), and Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC.

W IT N E S S E T H:

WHEREAS, the City is a municipal corporation of the first class of the State of Arkansas and, in its
government capacity, owns and operates the City of Fort Smith Solid Waste Disposal Facility (the
"Facility"), which is currently operated as a Class I landfill; and

WHEREAS, the City currently provides solid waste collection and disposal service to residential
and non-residential customers within the City; and

WHEREAS, Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC has the consent of the City to collect and dispose of solid
waste for non-residential customers within the corporate limits of the City; and

WHEREAS, the City has evaluated the possibility ofexercising its governmental option of providing
solid waste collection and disposal services to non-residential customers; and

WHEREAS, Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC desires to provide non-residential solid waste collection
and disposal services for customers located in Sebastian County within and without the corporate limits
of the city.

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual covenants and promises contained herein, and
intending to be legally bound hereby, the parties agree as follows:

1. Definitions
a. "Solid Waste," when used in this Agreement, shall have the meaning given to it in Section

25'261 of the Fort Smith Code of Ordinances.
b. "Residential Customers," when used in this Agreement, shall have the meaning given in

Section 25-261 of the Fort Smith Code of Ordinances.
c. "Non-residential Customers," when used in this Agreement, shall refer to all solid waste

customers who are not residential customers as defined by Section 25-261 of the Fort
Smith Code of Ordinances.

2. Disoosal of waste Generated within the citv
Solid Waste Disposal: Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC agrees that all solid waste generated
within the City and which is collected by Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC for disposal shall be
hauled by Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC to the Facility, except as otherwise provided
herein. Excepted from this requirement are: (i) anycategoriesofsolid wastethatthe City
does not accept for disposal at the Facility; (ii) any customers to which the City may
consent in writing executed by the Fort Smith City Administrator to allow to use
alternative disposal facilities; and (iii) any recyclables as defined in Section 25-261 of the
Fort Smith Code of Ordinances and any other recycling program identified in writing and
approved as an exception by the Fort Smith City Administrator. The City will use
reasonable efforts to enforce the designation of the Facility against all waste haulers.

a

b. Rates for Disposal: The rates for disposal of solid waste generated within the City and
disposed of at the Facility shall be those rates, established from time to time, by the City
for the customers of the Facility (the "Fort Smith Published Rates"). The City agrees that
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all waste haulers servicing Non-Residential customers within the City and delivering solid
waste to the Facility shallbe charged the same disposal rates.

c. Franchise Fee: An annual fee shall be five (5) percent of gross revenues for service
provided by the franchisee inside the City of Fort Smith city limits. This includes, servicing
dumpsters, roll-off containers, compactor containers, collection in refuse vehicles or
collecting and hauling refuse in open top trucks, owned or not owned by the franchisee,
that is serviced by the franchisee used in the City of Fort Smith.

i. The calculation ofgross revenues generated from operation within the city shall
include all revenue, as determined in accordance with generally accepted
accounting principles, which is derived, directly or indirectly, by the franchisee
from or in connection with its operation within the city. Gross revenues shall
include, but are not limited to revenues received from the collection and
disposal of all solid waste, whether by a company bearing franchisee's name or
a company owned or controlled by franchisee but operating under a different
name.

ii. That portion of the annual fee attributable to subsection C above must be paid
in a manner and on a schedule approved by the Solid Waste Services Director.

iii. The annual fee shall be paid quarterly, no later than thirty (30) days after the
end of each calendar quarter. The payment shall be made to the City of Fort
Smith Finance Department. No refund of a fee will be made.

iv. Fee payments received after the due date shall be subject to interest at the rate
of 10% until the fees are paid in full.

v. This agreement will be subject to non-renewal by the City should the franchise
fee NOT be paid by the franchisee when renewal is due. Non-renewal of
agreement will mean that fra nchisee/ha u ler will NOT be able to collect and
dispose of solid waste for non-residential customers within the corporate limits
of the City.

d. RFID Taps: The city has recently installed RFID readers for quicker entrance and exit to the
Landfill. These are available to haulers, however, it is not mandatory. The cost is

$2o/tag/year- Haulers must submit a list of equipment to the city for our records.
i. The total for all RFID tags will be billed annually to the haulers account. tnvoice

will be Net 30 days from time of billing. Subject to a late fee of ten (10%) of
amount owed should the invoice not be paid by the due date.

ii. One free replacement RFID tag, per tagged vehicle, annually. lf more RFID tags
are needed for same vehicle there will be an additional $20 per tag. Billed at the
next billing cycle to the haulers account.

3. Disposal of Waste Gene rated Outside the CiW
a. Rates for Disposal: The base rates cha rged for solid waste generated outside the City

"External Rate" and delivered to the Facility by Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC, shall be the
Fort Smith published rates.

b. The rates may be adjusted on the anniversary of each year of the term provided for in this
paragraph. On each anniversary date, the rates set forth in the Fort Smith published Rates
may be adjusted by the percentage that the Consumer Pricing lndex for All Urban Areas
("CPl-U") for the first calendar month ofthe preceding contract year was exceeded by the
CPI-U at the beginning of the next contract year. (The Cpt-U is based on the U.S.
Department of Labor, Bureau of Labor and Statistics, Consumer price lndex for all urban
customers in the U.S. city average, with all items having been computed based on 1982-
84 = 100.0)
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c. The rates provlded for in this paragraph 3 shall be subject to adjustment by the governing
body of the City of Fort Smith upon determination of the governing body that federal or
state regulatory agencies have adopted and implemented regulations which have a

significant, adverse effect on the rates charged for waste disposal at the Facility (the
percentage in change in the rates provided for in paragraph 3 ofthe Agreement shall not
exceed the percentage of rate change published by the City of Fort Smith for waste
generated within the city of Fort smith).

Permit: This Agreement shall constitute a permit issued by the City to Scarbrough Enterprises,
LLC, pursuant to Section 25-321 of the Fort Smith Code of Ordinances.
Billine and Pavments: Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC shall be subject to the City's standard
billing and payment terms and procedures for customers of the Facility.
Com liance with Laws: All waste provided by Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC to the Facility for
disposal shall comply with all current and future applicable Arkansas Department of
Environmental Quality Regulations, including Regulation 22 and Regulation 23; and all other
applicable federal, state and loca I environmental requirements. ln the event that Scarbrough
Enterprises, LLC delivers waste to the Facility that does not conform to the identified
regulations and requirements, Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC, shall be responsible for any cost
incurred by the City in the treatment and handling of the non-conforming waste.
Vehicles

a. License: All vehicles utilized by Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC to deliver solid waste to
the Facility pursuant to this Agreement shall have a hauler's license issued by the
Sebastian County Regional Solid Waste Management District.

b. Covered Loads: All solid waste delivered by Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC to the Facility
pursuant to this Agreement, shall be delivered in vehicles in which all loaded solid
waste is covered and secured to prevent blowing or dropping on public rights-of-way
or City-owned property from the point of location to the point of disposal at the
Facility.

8. lnspection of Records: Both parties shall have access to the governmental and business
records of the other party relevant to this Agreement, for the purpose of verifying any
information pertinent to this Agreement. Any exercise of such right of inspection shall occur
at the normal business office and during the normal business hours of the party who holds
the information Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC acknowledges that it will comply with reasonable
requests of the City for information regarding the types and amounts of solid waste being
disposed of at the Facility, as well as the location of the collection of the waste, as relevant to
this Agreement.

9. Ois ute Resolution: ln the event that either party believes that the other party is in violation
of any provision of this Agreement that party shall provide to the other party, in writing, a

notice of thealleged breach. Withinten(10) days of receipt of notice, the notified partyshall
respond to the allegations. lf the response does not resolve the issue, either party may
request, in writing, that a meeting of the parties and/or their authorized representatives, be
held. Such meeting shall be held within thirty (30) days of this request, at the Office of the
Fort Smith City Administrator. Except in an emergency situation, neither party may initiate
litigation regarding the alleged breach until the dispute resolution provisions, as set forth
herein, have been completed. lf this meeting does not result in a resolution of the dispute,
either party may pursue any appropriate legal or equitable remedies, including rescission,
with a court of competent jurisdiction.

10. Term: This permit and agreement shall have a term of two (2) years from D"y"*#-*, i#
to lffiEr3o,2ff+. -Trr-rtp- 2016

7
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11. Choice of Law: ThisAgreement shall be governed by the laws of the State of Arkansas.

12. Assignment: The provisions of this Agreement are notassignable byeither partywithoutthe
prior, written consent of the other party.

13. Revocation of franchise:
The board of directors may revoke any solid waste collection franchise if the
fra nchisee:

i. Fails to comply with any provision of this article, any other city ordinance, or
any state or federal law applicable to the collection and disposition of solid
waste material

ii. Makes a false statement in the application or in a hearing concerning the solid
waste collection franchise; or

iii. Fails to pay a fee required by the article at the time it was due
iv. Before revoking a franchise under subsection (a) above, the director shall

notify the franchisee in writing that the franchisee is being considered for
revocation. The notice must include the reason forthe proposed revocation,
and a statement that the franchisee has ten (10) days to comply with the
notice.

1. Franchise shall be revocable upon ten (10) days' notice by the City
when, in the opinion of the designated agent of the Fort Smith City
Administrator, the work being performed by Scarbrough Enterprises,
LLC is being performed in such a manner as to constitute a public
menace or nuisance or to be detrimental to the health, safety, and
welfare ofthe citizens ofthe City.

Should a franchisee have its franchise revoked, the franchisee may be granted a

period of time, up to a maximum of six (6) months, by the director to conclude its
solid waste business in the City of Fort Smith, as long as the franchisee continues
paying the set franchise fee and maintains the required insurance requirements.

14. Non-transferabil A solid waste collection franchise issued to one (1) person may not be

transferred to another person without authorization by the board of directors

15. lndemnification: Scarbrou gh Enterprises, LLC agrees to indemnify and hold harmless the City '
from and against any and all suits, actions, legal proceedings, claims, demands, damages,

costs, expenses, and reasonable attorneys'fees resulting from Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC

ope rations hereunder. Provided, however, thatScarbrough Enterprises, LLCshallnotbeliable
for any suits, actions, legal proceedings, claims, demands, damages, costs, expenses, or
attorneys' fees solely caused by the willful or negliBent acts or omissions of the City's

employees.

16. lnsurance: Scarbrough Enterprises, LLc shall at all times during the term of this Agreement'
maintain in full force and effect Employer's Liability, Workmen's Compensation, Public

Liability, and Property Damage lnsurance. Before commencement of work under this
Agreement, Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC agrees to furnish to the City certificates of insurance

or other evidence to the effect that such insurance has been procured and is in force. Forthe
purpose of this Agreement, Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC shall carry the following types of
insurance in at least the amounts specified below:

a

b

Workmen's Compensation Statutory
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Employer's Liability

Bodily lnjury Liability
(except automobile)

Property Damage liability
(except automobile)

s s00,000.00

$ 5fi),0o0.00/occurrence
S 1,(x)0,firc.00/aBgregate

S 500,000.00/occurrence
S 1,000,0o0.00/aggretate

Automobile Bodily lnjury Liability S 500,000.00/person
S 1,0O0,000.0O/occurrence

Automobile Property Damage Liability S 500,000.oo/occurrence

Excess Umbrella Liability $ 2,000,0()0.00/occurrence

17. Force Maieure: Neither party hereto shall be liable for its failure to perform hereunder due
to circumstances beyond its reasonable control, including, but not limited to, strikes or other
labor disputes, riots, civil disturbances or sabotage, fires, floods, explosions, accidents,
weather or acts of God affecting either party hereunder. tn the event any of the
circumstances listed in the preceding sentence, or if any federal, state or local court or
authority takes any action which would (i) close or restrict operations at the Facility, (ii) limit
the quantity or prohibit the disposal of waste at the Facility or, (iii) limit the ability of or
prohibit Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC, from delivering waste to the Facility, Scarbrough
Enterprises, LLC shall have the right, at its option, to reduce, suspend or terminate delivery of
waste to the Facility, as set forth hereunder, immediately, without prior notices and without
any additional liabilities between the parties.

18. Severabilitv: lf any provision of this Agreement shall be held to be invalid, illegal or
unenforceable in any respect, this Agreement shall remain in effect and be construed without
regard to such provision.

19. Entire reement: This Agreement constitutes the entire understanding between the

20

parties, replacing and amending any prior agreements between the parties, and shall be
binding upon all parties hereto, their successors, heirs, representatives and approved assigns.
Any provision, term or condition in any acknowledgment, purchase order or other response
by the City to Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC, or by Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC to the City, which
is in addition to or different from the provisions of this Agreement shall be deemed objected
to by the other party and shall be of no effect.
counterparts and Electronic signature: This Agreement may be executed in counterparts,
each of which shall be deemed an original and all of which together shall constitute one and
the same instrument. The facsimile, email or other electronically delivered signatures of the
parties shall be deemed to constitute original signatures, and facsimile or electronic copies
hereof shall be deemed to constitute duplicate originals. signatures delivered by facsimile,
email or other electronic means shall bind the signatory notwithstanding any subsequent
failure or refusal to deliver an original signature signed in ink.
Notices: Any notice required to be given pursuant to the provisions of this Agreement shall
be considered to be validly delivered, if it is sent by u.s. certified Mail or if it is hand delivered
and a signed receipt is obtained. Such notice should give the following:

27
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lf to the City

lf to

This Agreement is executed as of this
by the authorized representatives of the parties

City of Fort Smith - Solid Waste Services
Director of Solid Waste Services
5900 Commerce Rd

Fort Smith, AR 7291.6

Scarbrough Enterprises, LLC

Chris Scarbrough
PO Box 208
Howell, OK 74940

By

day of

CITY OF FORT SMITH, ARKANSAS

George B. Mccill, Mayor

Scarbrough arbrough Enterprises, LLC

ATTEST:

City Clerk

By
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KHAYNIEA(:ORD
SCARENT{1

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

lNsuRER(S) AFFORDTNG COVERAGE

INSURER A : NATIONAL AMERICAN INSURANCE CO 23663

5t31t2023

Rich & Cadmill, lnc.
2738 E.51st Streel, Suite 400
Tulsa. OK 74105

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSU ED AS A MAIIER OF INFORi'ATION ONLYAND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLOER, THIS
CERTIFICATE OOES NOT AF FIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMENO, EXTENO OR ALTER THE COVERAGE THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THEISSUI
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, ANO THE CERTIFICATE HOLOER.

IMPoRTANT: lf the certificate hotder is an AootIoNAL |NSURED, the policy{ies) must have AoDtfloNAL tNsu
I' SUBROGATION IS WAIVED,
this cerlaficate does not conter ri

subject to the terms and conditions of the
ts to the certificate holder in lieu ot such

policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
s

FR [1c' Julie eira

fll8xni,, .,,, (gra) zgs-zrla
[ffi!"" jbird@rcins.com

Scarbrough's Enterprises, LLC
22379 Nobles Rd
Howe, OK 74940

INSURER C

INSURER D

INSURER E

INSIJRER F

ES RTIFICATE N SION NUM
IHIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TOTHE INSUREDINDICATED NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REOUIREMENT. .rERM OR CONOITION OF ANY CONTRACT ONbrriENOb
CERTIFICAIE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERIAIN THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES LII\,IITS SHOWN MAY HAVE EEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS,

NA1VED ABOVE FOR IHE POLICY PERIOD
CIJI\,1ENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE IERMS

IN

A X couitEnc rAL GElten-ar rrnetri
CLATMS,MADE X occuq X X MP32800135 9t8t2022 9t8t2023

1,ooo.0abl

100,000

5,000

1,000,000

2,000.000

2,OOO,OOO

GEN'L AGGREGATE LII,!IT APPLIES PER

X porcv :I& Loc

li
A rutocoetLe tas[rw

X aryruto
OWNEO
AUTOS ONLY

X !LF%o"n"r" x

X X MP3280013s 91at2022 9t8t2023

9t412022 9t912023

COMBINEO SINGLE LIMIT

BODILY INJURY (P$ per$nl

BODILY INJURY lPer accdent)

SCHEDULED

1,000,000

2,000,000

2,000,000

umaREL[a LraB X occun
X ExcEss Lras CLATMS MAoE X X MB62230135

OEO RETENT ON $

s

$

$A wonxens cotteersrrron
ANO EMPLOYERS' f IABIf IIY
ANV PROPRIEIOH/PARTNER,EXECI]IIVF
gILlE5g[!Ift16.'..'oeo,

X cw52070135 918t2022 9/8/2023
X SFIrr-. orH-

E L EACh ACCIDENT

E L OISEASE. EA EMPLOYEE

E L OISEASE- POLICY LIMlr

1,000,000

1,000,000

1,000,000

OESCRIPTION OF OP€RATIONS / IOCATION
As r€quired by written conlract and
named as Additional lnsured as re6

s . VEHIC LES IACORD 10 t . Addit'onat R.m.r*s Sc h.ddt., mav be .[.ch.d ,t mor. so.e ,] r..u .dl
suDrecr to policy lerms and exclusions. certilicate Holder. owner, and othirs iequired of the contract, are included orpects General Liability, Auto Liability, and Excess Liability on a primary and non_;ontributory basis.

As required by written contract and subject to Policy lerms and exclusion, waiver of subrogation is inctuded in favor of certificate Hotder, owner, and othersrequired ofthe contract' as resp€cls Generar Liabirity, auto Liabirity, Exc;ss Liabiriry, and iorkers compensation.

ICATE H

City ot Fort Smith
Solid Waste Departm€nt
5900 Commerce Rd
Fo.t Smith, AR 72916

SHOULO ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBEO POLICIES BE CANCELLEO AEFORETHE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTIGE wlLL BE DELIVEREO INACCOROANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS,

LLA

AUIHORIZEO REPRESENTATIVE

frh
acoRD 2s (2016/03) o 1988.2015 ACORD CORPORATTON

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORO
All rights reserved

E:ACH OCCURRENCE S
DAMAGE TO RENTEO
PREMISES (Ea o@ufl€nce) I
MEo EXP (Any on€ oe6o.) S

PERSONAT&AOV INJURY S

GENERAL AGGRE GATE S

PROOUCTS. COMP/OP AGG 5

s

AGGREGAIE

l
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8uilh...ll.nr: scARBRoUGH,s EI{TER atsEs uc
!|r.ln tt Locdon: 22379 l{OBtES Ot

HowE, Ot( 7tgilo

Ownlr; CHRISIOP}IIR SCAREROUGH

Ilctnr!l{uftbcr: 006562-2021

Itru.d Drt.i - Alglzozz 
'

:rplr.:lmD.lGr 6/9/2024

{1} Buslnes5 neSrstrltrons are non-trensferrablc end mUst be po$ed in a conspicugui pl.ce in the li.€nsed businoss lo.rtion. fo
keep thl' retistatto. valid as Esues, rr is youf responsibility to le€p it current.
(2) This lcenre doeJ not ai,thorrc a b!!ineJ! to operat€ in conflict s,th the l3ws of the City ot fon gnith linclusive ot tonrn8
reguietions) oi the State o, A.kansas.
131 A change rn butness loaation, classiticatiom, or owneruhlp wlll nccaliltat! a naw licans! applicallon paoc!ss.

TO 3t 
'OSTtD 

lr{ A CO SPTCUOUS pl.AC€

BUSINESS REGISTNATION

lulind. Tf.(rl:
Mdlltg Addre.':

952111 Garb.a. collcction *rvlcet
PO AOX 20a
HOW€, O( 74940

Cortr.ctor'r Olfic€

O(rupatlonal Burlness

Uc.i3. Typ.:

O.r.ifi..tioi:

CITY OF FORT SMITH, AiKANSAS
OFFICE Of DEVETOPMEI{T SERVICES
523 6.rrison Avenue, Fort Smith, AR 72tO1
14791 7a1 2276 | plannrnt@fortsmath.r.tov

c .)l--) \,
V
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MEMORANDUM

5E

TO: Carl Geffken, City Administrator
CC: Stan Snodgrass, P.E. Director of Engineering
FROM: Alie Bahsoon, Purchasing Manager
DATE: 07/11/2023
SUBJECT: Martin Drive Properties Demolition

FISCAL IMPACT: $77,823.00
BUDGET INFORMATION: Budgeted / Engineering - Sales Tax Program

 

 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY

Bids were advertised for the demolition of 606 and 612 Martin Drive properties. These two
properties have had an ongoing history of flooding since 2007 and were acquired by the city
through the Flooded Residence Buyout Program (Project No. 22-90-A) and the purchase was
approved by the Board of Directors per Resolutions 141-22 & 168-22.

The Flooded Residence Buyout Program applies city wide. This program is used to purchase
residential properties that have experienced structure flooding if the cost of the
residence/property is less than the cost of public drainage improvements to reduce the
flooding.  The buyout program applies to residential structure flooding from a city maintained
drainage way, easement, street, or right of way. Examples of non-qualifying flood events
include structure flooding where the flood source is from neighboring properties, a hillside,
groundwater seepage, or the Arkansas River.

A mandatory pre-bid meeting was held on June 8 th and the only contractors present are the
two that submitted a bid proposal as noted below. I recommend that the bid from Howard
Construction as indicated below, be accepted.

CONTRACTOR 606 & 612 MARTIN DRIVE
Howard Construction *
Pocola, OK $77,823

J&J Dozer and Backhoe
Sallisaw, OK $82,768.34

ATTACHMENTS
1. 07-18-23_Item_475_Resolution.pdf
2. Demo Bid Tab-Granicus.pdf

 
 

Board of Directors Staff Report July 18, 2023
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RESOLUTION NO. ___________ 

RESOLUTION ACCEPTING BIDS FOR THE DEMOLITION OF 
606 AND 612 MARTIN DRIVE  

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE CITY OF FORT SMITH, 
ARKANSAS, THAT:  

The bids, as indicated by enclosure for the demolition of 606 Martin Drive and 612 Martin 
Drive, are accepted. 

This Resolution adopted this __________ day of July, 2023. 

APPROVED: 

__________________________________ 
Mayor 

ATTEST: 

____________________________________ 
City Clerk 

Approved as to form: 

_________________________________ 
No publication required 
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Martin Drive Properties Bid Tabulation 

 

 

 

CONTRACTOR 

606 Martin Drive & 

612 Martin Drive 

Howard Construction 

Pocola, OK 
$77,823✓ 

J&J Dozer and Backhoe 

Sallisaw, OK 
$82,768.34 

 

 

Date Advertised: June 5-6, 2023 

Date Opened: June 15, 2023 

✓ BID AWARD 
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MEMORANDUM

5F

TO: Carl Geffken, City Administrator
CC: Nicole R. Riley, Solid Waste Services Director
FROM: Alie Bahsoon, Purchasing Manager
DATE: July 11, 2023
SUBJECT: Fleet Vehicle Tires Bid Tabulation

FISCAL IMPACT: Not to exceed $200,000 annually
BUDGET INFORMATION: Budgeted / Solid Waste Services - Object Code 527200

(Maintenance-Equipment)

 

 
 
 
 
 
SUMMARY
An Invitation for Bid was released and advertised on June 18th for the purchase and
maintenance of tires for our waste collection fleet for the Solid Waste Services Department. In
addition to the advertisement, the Purchasing Department reached out to the local vendors
capable of providing these services for large fleets and only two responses were received. 
 
You will find attached a copy of the bid tabulation. The current bid with Tony’s Tire Service
expired in June of 2023.
 
In an effort to determine the best value bid received, we took an average of the tires/services
acquired from 2020 to 2023 YTD. Based on the average, the apparent low bidder is Tony’s
Tire Service which came in at $7,575 lower than that of the bid from Southern Tire Mart. This
is a 1 year agreement, with an option to renew for two additional 1 year periods. I am
recommending that the Board accept and approve the bids as noted by enclosure on the
attached bid tabulation.  
 
Funding for these services has been appropriated for in the 2023 Budget under the Solid
Waste Programs, Object Code 527200 (Maintenance-Equipment). 
 
Please let me know if you should have any questions

ATTACHMENTS
1. 07-18-2023_Item_476_Resolution.pdf
2. 07-18-23 Bid Tab Tires.pdf
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https://legistarweb-production.s3.amazonaws.com/uploads/attachment/pdf/2062495/07-18-2023_Item_476_Resolution.pdf
https://legistarweb-production.s3.amazonaws.com/uploads/attachment/pdf/2064504/07-18-23_Bid_Tab_Tires.pdf


RESOLUTION NO. ______ 

RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE BID AND AUTHORIZING THE PURCHASE 
AND MAINTENANCE OF WASTE COLLECTION FLEET VEHICLE TIRES 

FOR THE SOLID WASTE SERVICES DEPARTMENT 

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE CITY OF FORT 
SMITH, ARKANSAS THAT: 

The bid, as indicated by enclosure on the attached Bid Tabulation 6301-07-23-BA for the 
purchase and maintenance of solid waste collection fleet vehicle tires from Tony’s Tire of Fort 
Smith, is accepted. 

This Resolution adopted this day of July, 2023. 

APPROVED: 

______________________________ 
Mayor 

ATTEST: 

___________________________________ 
City Clerk 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

______________________________ 
No publication required 
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Type of Service Tony's Tire Southern Tire Mart Goodyear CT&SC
Steer Tire 11R22.5 Load Range H with Tread Depth 20/32 Mounted & Balanced * $325.00 $350.00 No Bid
Steer Tire 425/65R22.5 Load Range L with Tread Depth 24/32 Mounted & Balanced ** $525.51 $690.40 No Bid
Steer Tire 315/80R22.5 Load Range L with Tread Depth 25/32 Mounted & Balanced *** $410.80 $498.83 No Bid
Waste Handler/Drive Tire Recap 11R22.5 Tread Depth 30/32 - Vendor Casing Mounted **** $200.00 $200.00 No Bid

Waste Handler/Drive Tire Recap 11R22.5 Tread Depth 30/32 - Solid Waste Dept. Casing Mounted ***** $175.00 $165.00 No Bid
Valve Stem Replacement $3.00 $3.00 No Bid
Tire Disposal Fee $3.00 $3.00 No Bid
Nail Hole Repair

-When retreaded $5.00 $0.00 No Bid
-Without retreading $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Section Repair Cost
-When retreaded $10.00 $0.00 No Bid
-Without retreaded $0.00 $25.00 No Bid

Rim Refurbished Cost $25.00 $25.00 No Bid
Twice/Week Delivery Cost $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

 Bid Award

Options & Other Fees
Tire Mount & Dismount $10.00
Wheel Balance $10.00

Tony's Tire Service
Supermax 

Southern Tire Mart
* Firestone - 156558
** Firestone - 241235
*** Firestone - 244465
**** Bandage BDM Cap & Casing
***** Bandage BDM Customer Casing

Purchase & Maintenance of Waste Collection Fleet Vehicle Tires
Bid Tab #6301-07-23-BA

Tabulation of Bids - City of Fort Smith
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Type of Service Average Tony's Tire 
Anticipated 

Annual Spend
Southern Tire

Anticipated 
Annual Spend

Steer Tire 11R22.5 Load Range H with Tread Depth 20/32 Mounted & Balanced 55 $325.00 $17,875.00 $350.00 $19,250.00

Steer Tire 425/65R22.5 Load Range L with Tread Depth 24/32 Mounted & Balanced
15 $525.51 $7,882.65 $690.40 $10,356.00

Steer Tire 315/80R22.5 Load Range L with Tread Depth 25/32 Mounted & Balanced
78 $410.80 $32,042.40 $498.83 $38,908.74

Waste Handler/Drive Tire Recap 11R22.5 Tread Depth 30/32 Using Vendor Casing 
Mounted 394 $200.00 $78,800.00 $200.00 $78,800.00
Waste Handler/Drive Tire Recap 11R22.5 Tread Depth 30/32 Using Sanitation 
Department Casing Mounted 314 $175.00 $54,950.00 $165.00 $51,810.00

$191,550.05 $199,124.74
 Bid Award

4 Year Average Usage (2020-2023)
Purchase & Maintenance of Waste Collection Fleet Vehicle Tires

Bid Tab #6301-07-23-BA

2020 2021 2022 2023 Total Average
41 64 70 45 220 55

12 17 18 14 61 15

98 106 69 38 311 78

250 503 488 333 1574 394

350 335 350 222 1257 314
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MEMORANDUM

 

TO: Mayor and Board of Directors
FROM: Jessica Underwood, Executive Assistant
DATE:
SUBJECT: Appointment: Community Development Advisory Committee (1)

 

 
 
 
 
SUMMARY
Ms. Mishelle Davis resigns from the Community Development Advisory Committee. Ms. Genia
Smith is interested in reappointment. The other applicants Cristina Castorena and Lakeisha
Stinyard.
 
Appointments are made by the Board of Directors, one appointment is needed. The new term
will expire June 30, 2026.

ATTACHMENTS
1. CDAC Appointments 07.18.23.pdf
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https://legistarweb-production.s3.amazonaws.com/uploads/attachment/pdf/2061287/CDAC_Appointments_07.18.23.pdf
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MEMORANDUM

 

TO: Mayor and Board of Directors
FROM: Jessica Underwood, Executive Assistant
DATE: July 11, 2023
SUBJECT: Appointment: Fire Code Board of Appeals & Adjustments (3)

 

 
 
 
 
SUMMARY
The term of Mr. Chris Driggers on the Fire Code Board of Appeals and Adjustments termed on
October 30, 2021. Mr. Shannon Reith and Mr. Teddy Abbey have resigned. Three vacancies
are open. Applicants at this time are Belva Ross, Marlene Torres, and Trevor Campbell. 
 
Appointments are made by the Board of Directors, three appointments are needed. The new
terms will expire October 30, 2023, October 30, 2024 and October 30, 2025.

ATTACHMENTS
1. Fire Code of Appeals & Adjustments Appointments 7.18.23.pdf
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https://legistarweb-production.s3.amazonaws.com/uploads/attachment/pdf/2057654/Fire_Code_of_Appeals___Adjustments_Appointments_7.18.23.pdf
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MEMORANDUM

 

TO: Mayor and Board of Directors
FROM: Jessica Underwood, Executive Assistant
DATE: July 10, 2023
SUBJECT: Appointment: Historic District Commission (2)

 

 
 
 
 
SUMMARY
The term of Mr. Nate Deason and Mr. Robert Clock on the Historic District Commission will
expire on July 31, 2023. Mr. Deason and Mr. Clock are interested in reappointment. 
 
Appointments are made by the Mayor, two appointments are needed. The new terms will
expire July 31, 2026

ATTACHMENTS
1. Historic District Commission Appoitnemtns 07.18.23.pdf
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https://legistarweb-production.s3.amazonaws.com/uploads/attachment/pdf/2054492/Historic_District_Commission_Appoitnemtns_07.18.23.pdf
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MEMORANDUM

 

TO: Mayor and Board of Directors
FROM: Jessica Underwood, Executive Assistant
DATE: July 10, 2023
SUBJECT: Appointment: Property Owners Appeals Board (1)

 

 
 
 
 
SUMMARY
The term of Mr. Justin Sparrow on the Property Owners Appeal Board expires July 14, 2023.
Mr. Sparrow is interested in reappointment. No other applicants at this time. 
 
Appointments are made by the Board of Directors, one appointment is needed. The term will
expire July 14, 2028.

ATTACHMENTS
1. Property Owners Appeal Board - Appoitnements 7.18.23.pdf
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https://legistarweb-production.s3.amazonaws.com/uploads/attachment/pdf/2054360/Property_Owners_Appeal_Board_-_Appoitnements_7.18.23.pdf
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MEMORANDUM

 

TO: Mayor and Board of Directors
FROM: Jessica Underwood, Executive Assistant
DATE: July 10, 2023
SUBJECT: Appointment: Transit Advisory Commission (1)

 

 
 
 
 
SUMMARY
The term of Ms. JoAnne Elsken on the Transit Advisory Commission will expire July 15, 2023.
Ms. Elsken is interested in reappointment. The other applicant at this time is Lakeisha
Stinyard. 
 
Appointments are made by the Mayor, one appointment is needed. The new term will expire
July 15, 2026.

ATTACHMENTS
1. Transit Advisory Commission - Appointments 7.18.23.pdf
2. additional TAC application.pdf
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https://legistarweb-production.s3.amazonaws.com/uploads/attachment/pdf/2054599/Transit_Advisory_Commission_-_Appointments_7.18.23.pdf
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